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Disclaimer: This policy paper broadly explores the immensely nuanced and complex 
topic of rural immigrant health. The paper does not seek to address specific rural 
immigrant groups nor isolated health concerns facing rural immigrant groups. 
Subsequent papers that focus on specific issues within the domain of rural immigrant 
health are welcome. 
 
 

I. Introduction  

The National Rural Health Association is a national nonprofit membership organization 
comprised of a diverse assortment of nearly 21,000 individuals and organizations 
nationwide. Members share a commitment to our nation’s rural health and strive to 
ensure rural America has access to quality and affordable health care, regardless of an 
individual’s cultural background. Rural America is becoming increasingly diverse, so it is 
imperative that the rural safety net meets the needs of immigrant populations. 
 
 

II. A Closer Look at the Rural Immigrant Population 

Historically, the United States has been known as a “melting pot” of cultures, peoples 
and ethnicities. Contemporary perceptions dictate urban areas as the centers of 
immigration and culture, however, rural America has experienced increasing cultural 
and ethnic diversity as well. As Daniel Lichter puts it, “Rural and small town America 
have been largely excluded from...discussions [on diversity], despite the 
disproportionate potential influences of new minority populations...on small 
communities.”1 

 
As rural America becomes increasingly diverse, society must examine the particular 
health care disparities afflicting these groups. A 2011 policy brief adopted by the 
National Rural Health Association states, “while the largest number of the rural poor 
tend to be white, the highest rates of poverty tend to be among multiracial and 
multicultural populations.”2 As supported in the literature, rural minority populations are 
disproportionately restrained in their ability to purchase health insurance, pay for 
transportation to medical appointments, and afford healthy food and other requisites of 
a healthy lifestyle. 
 
So, who are these rural immigrants? They are young workers who hail from an array of 
nations and cultural backgrounds, as well as represent various racial and ethnic groups. 
While a majority of immigrants are Hispanic (54.2%), Asian and white immigrants 



 

 
 
 

comprise 40.2% of the immigrant population. Rural immigrants are generally younger 
and of working age than nonimmigrant populations: 79.3% of the rural immigrant 
population is between the ages of 18 and 64. While the majority of the rural immigrant 
population has at most a high school diploma, almost 40% of rural immigrants attended 
college, graduated college, or obtained a graduate degree.3 

  
III. Immigrants Economic Contributions to Rural America 

Immigrants’ contributions to American society and culture are often less visible in rural 
communities but are equally vital to immigrant contributions in urban areas. Rural 
immigrants infuse stagnant and struggling rural economies with new sources of labor, 
an increased consumer base, and entrepreneurial spirit, all while providing rural 
governments with additional tax revenue. In short, immigrants strengthen rural 
economies, as evidenced by the following examples.  
 
Case: Immigration in Minnesota4  
 
In the state of Minnesota, immigrants’ economic contributions are noticeable. A larger 
proportion of immigrants are between the ages of 25 and 44 years (46%) compared to 
the native-born population (25%). Also, Minnesota has a greater proportion of Asian and 
African immigrants and a smaller proportion of Hispanics immigrants than the U.S. as a 
whole. Minnesotan immigrant households have a collective buying power (that is, 
disposable income after taxes) of over $5 billion. By demanding goods that are not 
traditionally available in Minnesota, immigrants have spurred the inception of new 
businesses that cater specifically to immigrants’ demands. Their presence and 
significant buying power are vehicles for noteworthy economic stimulation. Additionally, 
immigrants in Minnesota pay $793 million annually in state and local taxes alone.  
 
In Minnesota, immigrants comprise 37.2% of lower-skilled workers. Because of their 
labor contributions, they are viewed as a “complement to the native-born workforce.” 
Additionally, immigrants work jobs that others simply do not desire. For example, Somali 
immigrants tend to live around and work for Minnesota’s food processing 
manufacturers. The same trend is observed among Hmong and Latino populations in 
the state. Thus, immigrant populations are meeting demands for labor.  
 
Case: Immigrants and Meat-Processing Industry5 

 
During the 1980s and 1990s, the meat-processing industry started using mass 
production that led to increased hiring of immigrant laborers and the relocation of 
factories to rural areas. During that time, the percentage of the meat-processing 
workforce that was Hispanic increased from 10% to 30% and the percentage of foreign-
born Hispanics increased from 50% to 82%.  
 



 

 
 
 

According to William Kandel, “the inflow of Hispanic labor transformed many rural 
communities, mitigating the decline of the population and stimulating local economies.” 
In fact, stemming the declining population led to economic stimulus. During the 1990s, 
Hispanic population growth in rural areas limited population decline in over one hundred 
non-metro counties throughout the Southeast. Immigrants “stimulated rural economies 
as consumers, in addition to contributing considerably to local sales, property and state 
tax revenues.” In Storm Lake, Iowa, the meatprocessing industry and a swell of the 
immigrant population has stimulated community development and the changing face of 
the community, where Whites now make up less than half of the population.6  
 
Case: Immigrants and Rural Farming  
 
Two million of the approximately 2.1 million farms in the United States, or 95%, are 
located in rural areas.7 Across the United States, immigrants are 1.5 times more likely to 
work in agriculture compared to a U.S.-born worker. In states such as Washington, 
Idaho, California, North Carolina and New Mexico, the ratio increases to 5.0, 4.7, 3.6, 
3.0 and 2.6 respectively.8 In Southeastern Michigan alone, it is estimated that the 
farmworker population contributed about $23.5 million dollars to the local economy, or 
$18,000 per worker annually.9  
 
Immigrant farmworkers are also vital to California’s economy and in particular, to the 
agricultural industry of the state. Devadoss and Luckstead demonstrated that 
“Immigrants have helped to expand labor-intensive agricultural commodities and to 
control production costs in recent years by providing the necessary supply of labor”.10  
 
In summary, immigrants’ presence is a boon to the economy in the form of increased 
workforce, cash flow and spending; property ownership and tax paying; and 
entrepreneurship. However, as with any demographic group, there are certain factors 
that limit economic contribution. This paper aims to consider one of those factors—
health. Recognizing immigrants’ unique and valuable contributions to rural economies, 
we must support the health of immigrants in order to foster their productivity and 
economic influence.  
 

IV. Immigrant Health Care Access and Health Disparities 
 
Overall, immigrants have lower rates of health insurance, use less health care and 
receive lower quality care than U.S.-born populations, however, there are differences 
among subgroups, depending on legal status, English proficiency residential location 
and stigma and marginalization. The two latter factors are relevant to immigrants living 
in rural areas where there may be fewer immigrants like themselves.11  
 
Some immigrants fear seeking care due to potential consequences for themselves or 
undocumented family members The Kaiser Health News reports health center officials 
across the country describe how local, state and national law enforcement authorities 



 

 
 
 

have staked out migrant clinics, detained staff members transporting patients to medical 
appointments and set up roadblocks near their facilities and health fairs as part of 
immigration crackdowns.12 If immigrant populations fear accessing needed services, 
they risk suffering negative health outcomes, due to lack of pediatric vaccinations, 
infection prevention, and management of chronic disease.13   
 
In conjunction with the aforementioned barriers to health care access in rural America, 
some immigrants also face severely limiting language barriers. Language and cultural 
barriers not only serve as a prohibitive factor for patients seeking care, but also result in 
poorer health outcomes upon receiving care. According to a study conducted by 
Georgetown University faculty, “…Spanish-speaking Latinos are less likely than whites 
to visit a physician or mental health provider, or receive preventative care, such as a 
mammography exam or influenza vaccination,” and the inabilities to communicate 
effectively “…may lead to patient dissatisfaction, poor comprehension and adherence, 
and lower quality of care.”14  
 
The toxic stress that immigrant families experience due to fear of deportation and 
separation from loved ones is increasingly impacting daily life, health and wellbeing. A 
2017 study conducted in five languages with 100 parents in immigrant families from 
countries of origin concludes that this toxic stress is particularly critical for children, 
many of whom are themselves citizens. The study points to potential long-term 
consequences for children in immigrant families, including poorer health outcomes over 
the lifespan associated with compromised growth and development and challenging 
social and environmental factors that influence health.15 

 
V. Healthcare Facilities to Serve Immigrants  

 
The health care organizations that form the rural safety net are the best resource to 
serve immigrant populations in rural areas. Primary among these are rural health clinics, 
health centers in rural areas and rural hospitals.  
 
Rural Health Clinics 
 
Rural health clinics (RHCs) are the second major safety net provider available to rural 
populations, including immigrants. They may be private or public practices but must be 
located in a health professional shortage area. A distinguishing characteristic of Rural 
Health Clinics is the requirement that they must employ at least a half-time midlevel 
practitioner (physician assistant, nurse practitioner, and/or a certified nurse midwife).16 
The population of patients treated at Rural Health Clinics is generally older and more 
likely to be non-Hispanic White than Health Center patients.17, 18  
 
Health Centers in Rural Areas 
 



 

 
 
 

Approximately one half (49%) of Health Centers are located in rural areas, which serve 
one in seven rural residents.19 Federally Qualified Health Centers (FQHCs) that receive 
federal Health Center Program funding and FQHC Look-Alikes that do not receive the 
same federal funding both must offer services to all persons, regardless of ability to 
pay.20 Health Centers may only charge a nominal fee for individuals under 100% of the 
federal poverty level and offer a sliding fee scale for individuals from 101%-200% of 
FPL.19 Since by law these Health Centers may not turn anyone away, it enables them to 
serve uninsured individuals. According to CMS, Health Centers do not account for the 
legal status of immigrants when providing care.21 In addition to primary care, health 
centers must provide the following services directly or indirectly via another provider: 
dental care, behavioral health, transportation and hospital and specialty care. The 
health centers that are funded to serve special populations—such as migrant and 
seasonal farmworkers, homeless and public housing residents—may offer services 
especially relevant to some immigrant groups in rural areas.22  
 
Rural Hospitals 
 
Rural Hospitals, including Critical Access Hospitals, are a vital but increasingly 
vulnerable part of the health safety net for rural residents, including immigrants. As 
such, they may be the only source of emergency department for treatment of true 
emergencies or provision of routine care for uninsured immigrants, as well as inpatient 
care, outpatient care, and care coordination services.22 

 
 

VI. Service Strategies of Benefit to Immigrants 
 
A number of health care delivery strategies may help address barriers to health care 
access for immigrants, as well as make health care more culturally and linguistically 
appropriate. 
 
Community Health Workers (CHW) 
 
CHWs are an invaluable workforce to combat access barriers and provide culturally and 
linguistically appropriate care. When working with vulnerable populations, accounting for 
cultural barriers and fears towards seeking health care remains important. A CHW can 
help minimize this restraint because she/he is a “trusted member of and/or has an 
unusually close understanding of the community served. This trusting relationship 
enables the worker to serve as a liaison/link/intermediary between health/social services 
and the community to facilitate access to services and improve the quality and cultural 
competence of service delivery.”23 The bond that CHWs have with the members of the 
community allows them not only physical access to the patients, but also to obtain 
pertinent health information that the patient may not feel comfortable disclosing to a 
lesser known health professional. Furthermore, many CHWs are “members of the 
communities in which they work.”24 Because CHWs live in the community, they have a 



 

 
 
 

holistic understanding of what resources are available for a healthy lifestyle; CHWs 
understand the barriers to accessing healthy food, getting to the nearest hospital, and 
preventing injury in local industries.  
 
In regards to immigrant health specifically, it is worthy of note that “many Community 
Health Workers are immigrants themselves.” This trend applies to a variety of immigrant 
populations. Thus, CHWs have first-hand experience with the health risks associated 
with immigration and the challenges to accessing care once having crossed the border. 
The CHW is likely able to connect with community members around this common 
experience, resulting in increased trust amongst community members.24  
 
Finally, “Community Health Workers are the most cost-effective addition to a health 
team…” When investing in Community Health Workers, “the net result is a reduction in 
urgent care or hospitalizations,” so much so that “for every dollar that’s invested in the 
Community Health Worker, the savings is as much as $7.”24 

 
National CLAS Standards 
 
The United States Department of Health and Human Services Office of Minority Health 
has developed The National Standards for Culturally and Linguistically Appropriate 
Services in Health Care (National CLAS Standards.25 With an underlying theme that 
“dignity and quality of care are rights of all and not the privileges of a few,” the National 
CLAS Standards provide a blueprint for providers and agencies to be able to administer 
services that meet both the cultural and linguistic needs of the patient community. The 
National CLAS Standards may be accessed for free, so they are affordable and 
accessible for rural practices.25 The NIH states “…cultural respect enables systems, 
agencies, and groups of professionals to function effectively to understand the needs of 
groups accessing health information and healthcare—or participating in research—in an 
inclusive partnership where the provider and the user of the information meet on 
common ground.”26 As helpful as CHWs can be, doctors, nurses, therapists, healthcare 
agencies, and other providers must be able to optimize their communications with the 
patient because having a positive experience with a provider leads to better health 
outcomes.  
 
Language Translation 
 
Although CHWs often speak the language of local immigrants and other community 
members, other health care professionals must still be able to communicate directly with 
patients without the assistance of a CHW or other staff member. According to the 
Bureau of Labor Statistics, interpreters and translators working in medical settings earn 
an average annual salary of nearly $50,000 and few are available in rural areas.27 For 
small rural practices and hospitals, employing sufficient translators to accommodate 
multiple languages is not financially or logistically feasible. Contracting with companies 
that provide medical translation in numerous languages over the phone is a realistic 



 

 
 
 

solution for rural health care providers to address immigrants’ linguistic barriers to 
health.  
 

VII. Recommendations  
  

1. Support the health of rural immigrants, which as a group, contribute greatly to the 
economic health of Rural America. 

2. Promote the use of Rural Health Clinics, Federally Qualified Health Centers and 
FQHC Look-Alikes, and Rural Hospitals as safety net providers to serve 
uninsured and underinsured immigrant patients. 

3. Promote the use of CLAS standards among rural providers in order to meet the 
cultural and linguistic needs of immigrant patients and their families.  

4. Increase the utilization of Community Health Workers as a culturally and 
linguistically appropriate workforce for immigrant outreach, education and case 
management in order to increase access to care, improve health care 
compliance and enhance overall health and wellness of immigrants in rural 
America. 

5. Explore the specific needs of refugees as a special subgroup of immigrants living 
in the United States.  

 
  



 

 
 
 

 
 

Bibliography 
 

1. Lichter, D. T. (2015). Immigration and the New Racial Diversity in Rural America. 
Rural Sociology, 77(1). doi:10.1111/j.1549-0831.2012.00070.x. 
 

2. Racial and Ethnic Health Disparities. National Rural Health Association. May 
2006:1-13. 
 

3. Shaefer, A. & Mattingly, M. J. (2016). Demographic and Economic 
Characteristics of Immigrant and Native-Born Populations in Rural and Urban 
Places. Carsey Research, 1 7. Retrieved July 5, 2017. 
 

4. Corrie, B. P., PhD & Radosevich, S., MPP. (2013). The Economic Contributions 
of Immigrants in Minnesota. Retrieved July 6, 2017, from 
http://cdn2.hubspot.net/hub/172912/file-371412567 
pdf/Economic_Contributions_of_Immigrants_in_Minnesota_2013.pdf 

 
5. Kandel, W. (2006, June 1). Meat-Processing Firms Attract Hispanic Workers to 

Rural America. Retrieved July 06, 2017, from 
https://www.ers.usda.gov/amberwaves/2006/june/meat-processing-firms-attract-
hispanic-workers-to-rural-america/ 

 
6. Cohen, Patricia. "Immigrants Keep an Iowa Meatpacking Town Alive and 

Growing." The New York Times. May 29, 2017. Accessed July 07, 2017. 
https://www.nytimes.com/2017/05/29/business/economy/storm-lake-iowa-
immigrantworkers.html. 

 
7. http://www.fb.org/newsroomfast-facts 

 
8. http://www.pewtrusts.org/en/multimedia/data-visualizations/2015/immigrant-

employmentby-state-and-industry 

 
9. Rosenbaum, RP. The Direct Economic Impact of Migrant Farmworkers on 

Southeastern Michigan. JSRI Working Paper 56, The Julian Samora Research 
Institute, Michigan State University, East Lansing, Michigan, 2001 

 



 

 
 
 

10.  Devadoss, S. and Luckstead, J. Contributions of Immigrant Farmworkers to 
California Vegetable Production. Journal of Agricultural and Applied Economics, 
40(3(2008):879- 894 

 
11. Derose K, Escarce J, Lurie N. Immigrants and Health Care: Sources of 

Vulnerability. September/October 2007 

 
12. Galewitz P. Migrant Health Clinics Caught In Crossfire Of Immigration Debate. 

Kaiser Health News Migrant Health Clinics Caught In Crossfire Of Immigration 
Debate Comments. http://khn.org/news/migrant-health-clinics-immigration-
debate/. Published June 6, 2012. Accessed August 1, 2016. (old 10 was deleted) 

 
13. Probst JC, Laditka SB, Wang J-Y, Johnson AO. Mode of Travel and Actual 

Distance Traveled for Medical or Dental Care by Rural and Urban Residents. 
Rural Health Research Center South Carolina Public Health. 
http://rhr.sph.sc.edu/report/ (6-1) mode of travel and actual distance traveled.pdf. 
Published May 2006. Accessed July 27, 2016. 

 
14. Georgetown University Health Policy Institute. Georgetown University Health 

Policy Institute. 2004 (5). 
http://hpi.georgetown.edu/agingsociety/pubhtml/cultural/cultural.html. Accessed 
July 18, 2016. 

 
15. Artiga S, Ubri P. Living in an Immigrant Family in America: How Fear and Toxic 

Stress are Affecting Daily Life, Well-Being, & Health. Kaiser Family Foundation 
December 2017 Issue Brief. 

 
16. Rural Health Clinics. - Centers for Medicare & Medicaid Services. 

https://www.cms.gov/medicare/provider-enrollment-
andcertification/certificationandcomplianc/rhcs.html. Published April 10, 2013. 
Accessed August 4, 2016. 

 
17. Radford AD, Kirk DA, Howard HA, Holmes M. Profile of Rural Health Clinics: 

Clinic and Medicare Patient Characteristics Review of 2009 Medicare Outpatient 
Claims Data. North Carolina Rural Health Research and Policy Analysis Center. 
March 2013:1-4. 

 



 

 
 
 

18. 2015 Health Center Data. National Program Grantee Data. 
http://bphc.hrsa.gov/uds/datacenter.aspx. Published 2015. Accessed August 4, 2016. 

 
19. Removing Barriers to Care: Community Health Centers in Rural Areas. National 

Association of Community Health Centers. 
http://nachc.org/wpcontent/uploads/2015/06/rural_fs_1013.pdf. Published October 2013. 
Accessed July 27, 2016. 

 
20. What are Federally Qualified Health Centers (FQHCs)? 

http://www.hrsa.gov/healthit/toolbox/ruralhealthittoolbox/introduction/qualified.html. 
Accessed July 21, 2016. 

 
21. Serving Special Populations: Immigrants Fast Facts for Assisters. marketplace.cms.gov. 

https://marketplace.cms.gov/technical-assistance-resources/immigration-fast-facts.pdf. 
Accessed July 27, 2016. 

 
22. Federally Qualified Health Centers (FQHCs) 

http://www.ruralhealthinfo.org/topics/federally-qualified-health-centers Accessed January 
3, 2018. 

 
23. Community Health Workers. Community Health Workers. 

https://www.apha.org/aphacommunities/member-sections/community-health-workers. 
Accessed July 20, 2016. 

 
24. Community Health Workers: Allies for Immigrant Health. Columbia University Mailman 

School of Public Health. https://www.mailman.columbia.edu/public-
healthnow/news/community-health-workers-allies-immigrant-health. Published 
July 14, 2015. 

Accessed July 20, 2016. 
25. Think Cultural Health - CLAS & the CLAS Standards. 
https://www.thinkculturalhealth.hhs.gov/content/clas.asp. Accessed July 18, 2016. 
26. Cultural Respect | National Institutes of Health (NIH). U.S National Library of 

Medicine. 
https://www.nih.gov/institutes-nih/nih-office-director/office-communications-

publicliaison/clear-communication/cultural-respect. Accessed July 18, 2016. 
27. 27-3091 Interpreters and Translators. U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics. 
http://www.bls.gov/oes/current/oes273091.htm. Published May 2015. Accessed July 21, 
2016. 


